
SALVAGE  TABULATION

REVISED 4-26-02 AT 11:41AM
Specification Number: F2998940002                                                                                                                                                Date: April 26, 2002

Project Description: USED FIRE EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 ANDY’S TRUCK &
EQUIPMENT

AUTO
WHOLESALERS

CRAIG HANSON AL WITVOET NICOLAS
ROBLES

BIG “O” MOVERS
& STORAGE

WILLIAMS
REBUILDERS

SUPPLY

DREYER EMT DERBY HILL
EQUIPMENT

 RICHARDS
AUTO SALES

COZZI IRON &
METAL INC.

ERICKSON
TRUCKS &

PARTS

FDD 427 $789.00 NO BID X $725.00 NO BID $800.00 $635.00 $675.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $807.00

FDD 428 $839.00 X $1,150.00 $800.00 $577.00 $680.00 $350.00 $907.00

FDD 429 $789.00 X $425.00 $400.00 $614.00 $500.00 $300.00 $127.00

FDD 453 $529.00 X $575.00 $900.00 $521.00 $350.00 $300.00 $207.00

FDD 454 $569.00 X $610.00 $900.00 $495.00 $350.00 $300.00 $807.00

FDD 461 $799.00 X $625.00 $1,000.00 $611.00 $1,100.00 $300.00 $1,107.00

FDD 462 $839.00 $726.00 $735.00 $1,000.00 $614.00 $1,500.00 $300.00 $1,107.00

FDD 470 $839.00 X $550.00 $1,000.00 $635.00 $950.00 $300.00 $907.00

FDD 471 $849.00 X $485.00 $1,000.00 $635.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $237.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

REVISED 4-26-02 AT 11:41AM
Specification Number: F2998940002                                                                                                                                                Date: April 26, 2002

Project Description: USED FIRE EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 ACTION IRON &
METAL

FDD 427 $1,601.99

FDD 428 $1,601.99

FDD 429 $1,601.99

FDD 453 $1,601.99

FDD 454 $1,601.99

FDD 461 $1,601.99

FDD 462 $1,601.99

FDD 470 $1,601.99

FDD 471 $1,601.99

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


