
SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940014                                                                                                                                                                          Date: October 26, 2000

Project Description: Sale 28 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                                         Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 1 Jimmy EDCA AL SAL. Richards Vintage T & B Mgt & Mre Georges Derby Hill Al Vitvoet Al Gutensc Illiana

1)   FDS062 X X X $888.00 NO BID $355.21 $50.00 X $2,567.00 $2,850.25 X $2,510.00

2)   DT0047 X $56.00 X $212.00 X $50.00 $380.00 X X $328.11 X

3)    EN0001 X $26.00 X $32.00 X X X X X X X

4)    EN0004 X $356.00 X $276.00 $351.22 X $260.00 X X X X

5)   ET0002 X $26.00 X $30.00 $210.51 X X X X X X

6)   FDA317 X $356.00 X $226.00 X X $240.00 X X X X

7)   GS0115 $550.00 $456.00 X $366.00 $370.52 X X X X $409.11 $210.00

8)   GS3601 X $26.00 X $65.00 X X X X X X $110.00

9)   GS3602 X $26.00 X $176.00 $310.52 X X X X $178.14 $110.00

10)   HS0111 X $26.00 X $26.00 $151.22 X X X X X X

11)   GS3902 $425.00 $356.00 X $212.00 X X $380.00 X X $712.16 $760.00

12)   INSPG15 X $11.00 X X X X X X X X X

13)   INSPG17 X X X X X X X X X X X

14)   PV0119 X $26.00 X $36.00 X X X X X X X

15)   PV2077 $325.00 $101.00 X $112.00 X X $360.00 X X $351.06 $510.00

16)   SO3603 X $26.00 X $36.00 X X X X X $252.04 $110.00

17)   SO3835 X $56.00 X $30.00 X X X X $100.00 $254.06 $210.00

18)   11437 X X X $681.00 $251.21 X X $1,567.00 X X $2,010.00

19)   12318 X X X $155.00 X X X $667.00 $850.56 X $1,010.00



SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940014                                                                                                                                                                          Date: October 26, 2000

Project Description: Sale 28 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                                         Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg.2 Jimmy EDCA AL SAL. Richards Vintage T & B Mgt & Mr Georges Derby Hill Al Vitovet Al Gutensc Illiana

20)   PV2049 X $26.00 X $31.00 NO BID X X X X X x $110.00

21)   S13337 $650.00 $26.00 X $261.00 $351.52 X X X X $309.04 $110.00

22)   SO3858 X $56.00 $389.89 $30.00 $175.55 X X X $100.00 $179.06 $210.00

23)   SO3839 X $26.00 X $35.00 X X X X $100.00 $251.05 $210.00

24)   SO3837 X $56.00 X $30.00 X X X X $100.00 $128.06 $210.00

25)   RVP948 X $456.00 X $376.00 $275.53 X $380.00 X X $859.04 $310.00

26)   RVP947 $525.00 $356.00 X $376.00 $175.52 X X X X $759.04 $310.00

27)   RVP944 $425.00 $256.00 X $226.00 $225.52 X X X X $461.07 $110.00

28)   GSO116 X $26.00 X $30.00 $251.25 $50.00 X X $480.92 $409.17 $210.00



SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940014                                                                                                                                                                          Date: October 26, 2000

Project Description: Sale 28 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                                         Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 3 Kemetian COZZI Michael Rashid Erickson IDEAL ARSCO

1)   FDS062 X $60.00 $1,501.00 X $1,357.00 $4,669.00 NO BID

2)   DT0047 X $30.00 X $868.50 X X

3)    EN0001 X $30.00 X X X $329.00

4)    EN0004 X $30.00 X $558.00 $157.00 X

5)   ET0002 X $30.00 X X X X

6)   FDA317 $251.00 $30.00 X X $627.00 X

7)   GS0115 X $30.00 X X X $429.00

8)   GS3601 X $30.00 X X X X

9)   GS3602 X $30.00 X X X X

10)   HS0111 X $30.00 X X X X

11)   GS3902 X $30.00 X X X $1,729.00

12)   INSPG15 X $30.00 X X X X

13)   INSPG17 X $30.00 X X X X

14)   PV0119 X $30.00 X X X $329.00

15)   PV2077 X $30.00 X X X $769.00

16)   SO3603 X $30.00 X X X X

17)   SO3835 X $30.00 X X X X

18)   11437 X $60.00 X X $927.00 $269.00

19)   12318 X $30.00 X X $101.00 $429.00



SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940014                                                                                                                                                                          Date: October 26, 2000

Project Description: Sale 28 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                                         Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 4 Kemetian COZZI Michael Rashid Erickson IDEAL ARSCO

20)   PV2049 X $30.00 X X X X NO BID

21)   S13337 X $30.00 X X X $469.00

22)   SO3858 X $30.00 X X X $569.00

23)   SO3839 X $30.00 X X X     $469.00    

24)   SO3837 X $30.00 X X X X

25)   RVP948 X $30.00 X X X $769.00

26)   RVP947 X $30.00 X X X $769.00

27)   RVP944 X $30.00 X X X X

28)   GSO116 X $30.00 X X X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies
Richard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


