
REVISED 11-5-01 AT 1:43PM                     SALVAGE TABULATION
Specification Number: F1998940007                                                                                                                                                           Date: November 5, 2001

Project Description: USED TRUCKS AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                  Contract Administrator: J. Picl

Name of Bidder SW0211 SW2266 SW2267 SW2268 SW2269 SW5008 SW5009 SW5014 SW5015 SW5016

BOBS CRANE & DEMO. X $1,160.00 $2,675.00 $860.00 $865.00 $128.00 $110.00 $132.00 $167.00 $118.00

AL GUTENSCHWAGER X $603.41 $1,003.24 $509.17 $847.09 $75.76 $50.51 $52.53 $54.55 $56.57

MICHAEL J. ONEILL $301.00 X X X X X X X X X

AL WITVOET X $2,350.00 $2,500.00 $1,650.00 $2,550.00 $550.00 $550.00 $560.00 $555.00 $575.00

T&B CARTAGE CO. $125.56 $575.58 $1,258.75 $875.51 $1,055.80 $375.56 $475.83 $275.58 $350.58 $551.26

AUTO WHOLESALERS NO BID

TROY IRON WORKS X X $3,500.00 X X X X X X X

RICHARDS AUTO SALES $35.00 X X $810.00 X X X X X X

DERBY HILL EQUIPMENT X $3,567.00 $5,567.00 $2,267.00 $3,167.00 $1,267.00 $1,267.00 $2,567.00 $967.00 $2,567.00

HOEKSTRA & SONS X X $2,777.00 X $2,477.00 $777.00 $1,477.00 $1,777.00 $1,477.00 $2,177.00

ERICKSON TRUCKS N PARTS X $1,107.00 $1,657.00 $807.00 $1,307.00 $107.00 $227.00 $67.00 $67.00 $257.00

CITY UTILITY EQUIPMENT $300.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $800.00 $1,000.00 $400.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $600.00

MAMIE TOWING X X $500.00 $500.00 X X X X X X

ANDY’S TRUCK & EQUIP. X $2,298.00 $2,389.00 $1,789.00 $2,298.00 $789.00 $669.00 $669.00 $689.00 $769.00

SAEED AUTO SALES $77.00 $207.00 $455.00 $607.00 $207.00 X X X X X

VINTAGE VEHICLES & PARTS NO BID

TRUCK & PARTS OF OHIO NO BID

DC SALES X $2,777.00 $2,777.00 $1,255.00 $2,777.00 $677.00 $501.00 $501.00 $501.00 $501.00
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GASPAR GONZALEZ NO BID
Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
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