
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940027                                                                                                                                               Date: January 15, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 Derby Hill
Equipment

Michael O’Neill Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Auto
Wholesalers

Al Witvoet Lubbers & Son American Waste
Haulers

Airline Towing,
Inc.

Windsor Manor Electric DC Sales Ramon Alvarez

1) PK3181 $2,267.00 X NO BID NO BID $1,750.50 $1,260.00 X X X X X X

2) PK1658 X X $1,535.50 $1,110.00 $200.00 X X X X $301.00

3) PK1149 X X X X X X X X X X

4) PK7906 X X $2,550.50 $1,600.00 $250.00 $500.00 X X X X

5) PK3181 $2,267.00 X $525.00 X $750.00 $800.00 X X X X

6) PK1008 X X X X X X X X X X

7) PK3355 X X X X X X X X X X

8) PK3343 X X X X X X X X X X

9) PK3193 $4,267.00 X $3,550.25 $2,760.00 X $2,600.00 $200.00 X $2,777.00 X

10) PK3346 X X X X X X X X X X

11) PK7423 $5,767.00 $101.00 $4,550.65 $6,260.00 $1,200.00 $3,000.00 $500.00 X $2,277.00 $305.00

12) PK3348 X X X X X X X X X $95.00

13) PK1084 X X X X X X X X X X

14) PK1153 X X X X X X X X X $101.00

15) PK0102 $357.00 X $250.50 $310.00 X X X X X X

16) PK1098 X X $875.35 X $300.00 X X X X $555.00

17) PK1022 X X X X X X X X X X

18) PK1015 X X X X X X X X X $195.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940027                                                                                                                                               Date: January 15, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 Derby Hill
Equipment

Michael O’Neill Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Auto
Wholesalers

Al Witvoet Lubbers & Son American Waste
Haulers

Airline Towing,
Inc.

Windsor Manor Electric DC Sales Ramon Alvarez

19) PK1010 X X NO BID NO BID X X X X X X X $195.00

20) PK1359 X X X X X X X X X X

21) PK3191 $3,767.00 $101.00 $2,750.35 X $2,600.00 $2,700.00 X X X X

22) PK3369 X X X X X X X X X $195.00

23) PK1061 X X X X X X X X X $125.00

24) CPD792 X X $1,000.00 $1,260.00 X $1,200.00 X $1,500.00 $777.00 X

25) PK1095 X X X X X X X X X $301.00

26) PK1034 X X X X X X X X X X

27) PK3304 X X X X X X X X X X

28) PK1085 X X X X X X X X X X

29) PK1126 X X X X X X X X X $101.00

30) PK1137 X X X X X X X X X X

31) PK1114 X X X X X X X X X X

32) PK1007 X X X X X X X X X $125.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940027                                                                                                                                               Date: January 15, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 3 Erickson
Trucks-N-Parts

T&B Cartage A&M Auto WISCAN, LLC.

1) PK3181 $1,631.77 X $1,055.00 X

2) PK1658 $551.77 X $755.00 X

3) PK1149 X X $105.00 X

4) PK7906 $311.77 $2,875.00 X X

5) PK3181 $1,631.77 X X X

6) PK1008 X X $105.00 X

7) PK3355 X X $185.00 X

8) PK3343 X X $105.00 X

9) PK3193 $3,631.77 X $1,155.00 $8,888.88

10) PK3346 X X $105.00 X

11) PK7423 $3,611.77 X $1,255.00 $4,889.88

12) PK3348 X $4,333.00 $105.00 X

13) PK1084 X X X X

14) PK1153 X X $105.00 X

15) PK0102 $311.77 X X X

16) PK1098 X X $305.00 X

17) PK1022 X X X X

18) PK1015 X X $105.00 X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940027                                                                                                                                               Date: January 15, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 4 Erickson
Trucks-N-Parts

T&B Cartage A&M Auto WISCAN, LLC.

19) PK1010 X X $105.00 X

20) PK1359 X X X X

21) PK3191 $2,631.77 X $300.00 $2,889.88

22) PK3369 X X $105.00 X

23) PK1061 X X X X

24) CPD792 $311.77 X $1,855.00 X

25) PK1095 X X $105.00 X

26) PK1034 X X X X

27) PK3304 X X X X

28) PK1085 X X X X

29) PK1126 X X $155.00 X

30) PK1137 X X X X

31) PK1114 X X $105.00 X

32) PK1007 X X X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


