
                                     BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B99881502                                                                               Date: February 4, 2000           
                       
Project Description: Installation, Repair, Replacement and Maintenance of Chain Link Fence, Ornamental
Iron Fence, Ornamental Ironwork, Gates, Bollards and Guardrails (General Services Contract)  from page 84 

Bid Deposit: $   10,000.00                                                      Addendum __1 __2 X 3 __4                Contract Administrator: J. Moll

NAME OF BIDDER TOTAL BASE BID AWARD CRITERIA

Universal Iron Works No Bid  

G.F. Structures Corp. $4,101,230.00 $4,023,306.63

Peerless Enterprises Inc. $4,298,020.00 $4,181,973.46

Fence Builders or Illinois Inc. No Bid

Fence Masters Inc. No Bid

Turf Care Landscaping Inc. $2,425,066.40 $2,308,663.25

Tru-Link Fence Products $2,815,214.60 $2,707,391.25

Midwest Fence Corp. $12,791,500.00      $12,576,761.10    

Schoenbeck Corp. No Bid

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
     City of Chicago       Richard M. Daley, Mayor     Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies        Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing



                                     BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B99881502                                                                               Date: February 4, 2000       
                            
Project Description: Installation, Repair, Replacement and Maintenance of Chain Link Fence, Ornamental
Iron Fence, Ornamental Ironwork, Gates, Bollards and Guardrails (Ornamental Iron Work) Page 116

Bid Deposit: $   10,000.00                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                Contract Administrator: J. Moll

NAME OF BIDDER TOTAL BASE BID AWARD CRITERIA

Universal Iron Works $2,075,245.00 $2,017,554.49

G.F. Structures Corp. $1,645,655.00 $1,614,387.55

Peerless Enterprises Inc. $1,803,985.00 $1,755,277.40

Fence Builders or Illinois Inc. $1,529,905.00 $1,525,315.28

Fence Masters Inc. $1,883,440.00 $1,862,722.20

Turf Care Landscaping Inc. $2,393,493.45 $2,278,605.75

Tru-Link Fence Products $1,416,760.95 $1,362,499.01

Midwest Fence Corp. $2,321,250.00 $2,282,717.25

Schoenbeck Corp. $1,691,066.00 None Given    (Cond. Accepted)

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
     City of Chicago       Richard M. Daley, Mayor     Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies        Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing Agent



                                     BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B99881502                                                                               Date: February 4, 2000       
                            
Project Description: Installation, Repair, Replacement and Maintenance of Chain Link Fence, Ornamental
Iron Fence, Ornamental Ironwork, Gates, Bollards and Guardrails (Dept. of Aviation Contract) Page 123

Bid Deposit: $   10,000.00                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                Contract Administrator: J. Moll

NAME OF BIDDER TOTAL BASE BID AWARD CRITERIA

Universal Iron Works No Bid No Bid

G.F. Structures Corp. $4,706,599.00 $4,617,173.62

Peerless Enterprises Inc. $5,926,656.00 $5,766,636.29

Fence Builders or Illinois Inc. No Bid No Bid

Fence Masters Inc. No Bid

Turf Care Landscaping Inc. $5,555,700.00 $5,514,032.25

Tru-Link Fence Products $3,919,379.00 $3,769,266.78

Midwest Fence Corp. $16,733,000.00   $16,455,232.20

Schoenbeck Corp. No Bid No Bid

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
     City of Chicago       Richard M. Daley, Mayor     Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies        Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing Agent


