
Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications .  
City of Chicago, Richard M. Daley, Mayor 
Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies, Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing Agent

         DEMOLITION BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: C968000001                                                                                                                                                                   Date: January 11, 2000

Project Description: Request for Demolition Services Fast Track Class “D” Demolition Bids

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                                                Contract Administrator: J. Moll  

NAME OF BIDDER 2237 W. 18th

St
749 W. 54th

St.
832 W. 50th

St.
5006 S.

Carpenter
10217-19 S.

Halsted
5836 S. Lowe 6220 S.

Oakley
5145 S.
Paulina

1759 N.
Albany

C & L Demolition $10,900.00 $8,000.00 $6,800.00 $9,600.00 $10,000.00 $9,600.00 $6,500.00 $9,600.00 $9,900.00

Oak Park Inc. $9,995.00 $4,250.00 $4,400.00 $4,300.00 $4,900.00 $4,700.00 $3,959.00 $9,999.00 $9,995.00

Dearborn Demolition $9,100.00 $9,800.00 $9,600.00 No Bid No Bid $9,999.00 $9,100.00 $9,400.00 No Bid

Dan-Mar Demolition No Bid $8,025.00 $4,280.00 $5,980.00 $6,100.00 $4,900.00 $2,985.00 $7,250.00 No Bid

Certified Wrecking Co Inc. $9,740.00 $9,160.00 $6,900.00 $9,370.00 No Bid No Bid $7,900.00 No Bid No Bid

“A” Wrecking $12,000.00 $4,400.00 $9,500.00 $11,000.00 $9,500.00 $4,800.00 $9,700.00 $9,600.00 $11,000.00

Cabtech Corporation $9,990.00 $6,325.00 $5,325.00 $6,925.00 $6,500.00 $6,700.00 $5,950.00 $7,525.00 $8,575.00

J.F. Hauling $7,900.00 No Bid $6,500.00 $7,800.00 No Bid $7,900.00 $6,100.00 $7,500.00 $7,800.00

Delta Demolition No Bid $6,500.00 $4,800.00 $5,500.00 $6,900.00 $5,800.00 $5,200.00 $7,300.00 $9,300.00

ACS Inc. $16,234.00 $8,734.00 $5,034.00 $5,034.00 $7,434.00 $5,934.00 $5,634.00 $8,934.00 No Bid


