
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 1 Rashid Chuck Malak Arthur Kidd T&B Cartage Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Cozzi Iron &
Metal, Inc.

EDCA Auto Castenada A-1 Salvage Richards Auto
Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Tom McIntosh

1) SO3547 X X X X NO BID $35.00 $55.00 X X NO BID NO BID X

2) SO3319 X X X X $35.00 $216.00 X X X

3) RVP938 X X X X $35.00 $216.00 X X X

4) FDA311 X X X X $40.00 $895.00 X X X

5) FD324 $801.00 X X $1,250.95 $40.00 $1,106.00 X X X

6) PV0072 $801.00 X X X $40.00 $1,111.00 X X X

7) RV9005 X X X X $40.00 $1,406.00 X X X

8) RV936 X X X X $35.00 $107.00 X X X

9) 00001 X X X $175.56 $35.00 $51.00 X X X

10) RV0997 X X X X $35.00 $356.00 X X X

11) 00002 X X X X $40.00 $856.00 X X X

12) FDA332 X X X X $40.00 $251.00 X X X

13) FDA369 $1,201.00 X X X $45.00 $1,256.00 X X $1,369.00

14) SO3851 X X X X $35.00 X X X X

15) SO3824 X X X $125.56 $35.00 X X X X

16) DT0183 X $1,559.00 X X $45.00 $1,406.00 X X X

17) HS3408 $668.00 X X X $35.00 X X X X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 2 Rashid Chuck
Malak

Arthur
Kidd

T&B
Cartage

Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Cozzi Iron
& Metal,

Inc.

EDCA
Auto

Castenada A-1
Salvage

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Tom
McIntosh

18) PV0105 $458.00 X X X NO BID $40.00 $1,144.00 X X NO BID NO BID X

19) FDA370 X X X X $40.00 $303.00 X X X

20) 13337 X X X $155.10 $35.00 $26.00 X X X

21) FDA327 X X X X $40.00 $506.00 X X X

22) FDA313 X X X $1,510.65 $40.00 $856.00 X X X

23) FDA315 X X X X $40.00 $857.00 X X X

24) 12659 X X X X $40.00 $1,606.00 X X X

25) FDA347 X X X X $40.00 $556.00 X X X

26) CS0090 X X X $350.65 $40.00 X X X X

27) GS0159 $1,301.00 X X X $45.00 $1,706.00 $1,789.99 X X

28) FDA323 X X X X $40.00 $1,305.00 X X X

29) AVC051 X X X X $45.00 $2,106.00 X X X

30) GS1016 X X X X $45.00 $1,906.00 X $1,789.59 X

31) FDA364 $1,209.00 X X X $40.00 $1,306.00 X X X

32) FDA321 X X X X $40.00 $956.00 X X X

33) FDA318 X X X X $40.00 $1,188.00 X X X

34) FDA363 $1,259.00 X X X $40.00 $1,451.00 X X X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 3 Rashid Chuck
Malak

Arthur
Kidd

T&B
Cartage

Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Cozzi Iron
& Metal,

Inc.

EDCA
Auto

Castenada A-1
Salvage

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Tom
McIntosh

35) FDA356 $1,239.00 X X X NO BID $40.00 $1,576.00 X X NO BID NO BID X

36) AVC026 $2,201.00 X X X $50.00 $3,306.00 X X $2,869.00

37) FDA303 X X X X $40.00 $551.00 X X X

38) FDA310 X X X X $40.00 $956.00 X X X

39) AVC019 X X X X $45.00 $3,106.00 X X X

40) FDA314 X X X X $40.00 $1,206.00 X X X

41) AVC018 $1,268.00 X X $2,153.75 $40.00 $1,400.00 X X X

42) AVC943 X X X $810.75 $40.00 $2,307.00 X X X

43) GS0135 $1,668.00 X X $1,410.58 $40.00 $2,406.00 X X X

44) AVC900 $2,668.00 X X X $45.00 X X X X

45) FM2059 X X $700.00 $1,012.57 $45.00 X X X X

46) SO3557 X X X X $35.00 $286.00 X X X

47) SO3523 X X X $250.76 $35.00 $386.00 X X X

48) WSC103 $2,268.00 X X $1,150.95 $45.00 X X X X

49) WST457 X X X $275.58 $40.00 $151.00 X X X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 4 Rashid Chuck
Malak

Arthur
Kidd

T&B
Cartage

Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Cozzi Iron
& Metal,

Inc.

EDCA
Auto

Castenada A-1
Salvage

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Tom
McIntosh

50) NA0072 X X X X NO BID $40.00 $451.00 X X NO BID NO BID X

51) SO3541 X X X X $35.00 $316.00 X X X

52) PV2036 X X X X $35.00 X X X X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 5 Hoekstra
& Sons

Gaspar
Gonzalez

Jim Carew Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

Craig
Hanson

Welcome
Motors

Larese
Mitchell

Saeed
Auto Sales

1) SO3547 NO BID X NO BID X X X X X

2) SO3319 X X X X X $277.00

3) RVP938 X X X X X $57.00

4) FDA311 X $627.00 X X X $376.00

5) FD324 X $1,107.00 X $926.00 X $777.00

6) PV0072 X $257.00 X X X $111.00

7) RV9005 X $307.00 X X X $477.00

8) RV936 X X X X X X

9) 00001 X X $302.00 X X $77.00

10) RV0997 X X X X X $407.00

11) 00002 X $207.00 X X X $377.00

12) FDA332 X $227.00 X $826.00 X $477.00

13) FDA369 X $1,107.00 X $1,426.00 X $777.00

14) SO3851 X $257.00 X X X $577.00

15) SO3824 X X X X X $57.00

16) DT0183 X $907.00 X X X $477.00

17) HS3408 X X X X X $677.00

18) PV0105 X $1,107.00 X $1,426.00 X $777.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 6 Hoekstra
& Sons

Gaspar
Gonzalez

Jim Carew Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

Craig
Hanson

Welcome
Motors

Larese
Mitchell

Saeed
Auto Sales

19) FDA370 NO BID X NO BID $117.00 X X X $327.00

20) 13337 $136.00 X X X X $53.00

21) FDA327 X $107.00 X X X $527.00

22) FDA313 X $307.00 X X X $313.00

23) FDA315 X $627.00 X X X $313.00

24) 12659 X $427.00 $1,569.00 $1,426.00 X $627.00

25) FDA347 X $107.00 X X X $777.00

26) CS0090 X X X X X $107.00

27) GS0159 X $1,527.00 X X X $527.00

28) FDA323 X $907.00 X $1,126.00 X $777.00

29) AVC051 X $407.00 X $1,726.00 X $877.00

30) GS1016 X $1,407.00 X $1,626.00 X $877.00

31) FDA364 X $407.00 X $1,426.00 X $577.00

32) FDA321 X $217.00 X X X $277.00

33) FDA318 X $257.00 X X X $285.00

34) FDA363 X $427.00 X $1,426.00 X $557.00

35) FDA356 X $307.00 X X X $313.00

36) AVC026 X $1,807.00 X $3,626.00 X $1,107.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940006                                                                                                                                             Date: August 23, 2001

Project Description: 52 USED VEHICLES 

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 7 Hoekstra
& Sons

Gaspar
Gonzalez

Jim Carew Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

Craig
Hanson

Welcome
Motors

Larese
Mitchell

Saeed
Auto Sales

37) FDA303 NO BID X NO BID X $472.00 X X $779.00

38) FDA310 X $707.00 X X X $313.00

39) AVC019 X $1,407.00 $2,663.00 X $900.00 $413.00

40) FDA314 X $917.00 X X X $313.00

41) AVC018 X $1,207.00 X $1,526.00 X $779.00

42) AVC943 X $1,107.00 X X X $477.00

43) GS0135 X $1,257.00 X $1,726.00 X $1,007.00

44) AVC900 X $1,107.00 X $3,626.00 $1,200.00 $317.00

45) FM2059 $1,568.00 $307.00 X X X $277.00

46) SO3557 X $167.00 X X X $281.00

47) SO3523 X $167.00 X X X $281.00

48) WSC103 X $807.00 X $2,626.00 X $707.00

49) WST457 X X X X X $577.00

50) NA0072 X X X X X $377.00

51) SO3541 X X X X X X

52) PV2036 X X X X X $155.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   City of Chicago   Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


