
BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP A-1 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP B-1 X X X X X X $38,100.00 X X X X

GROUP C-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-1 X X $57,766.25 X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP G-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP H-1 X X X X $39,760.00 $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-1 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP J-1 $42,040.00 X X X X X X $35,290.00 X X X

GROUP K-1 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP N-1 X X X X X X X X X X $42,000.00

GROUP O-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP P-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Q-1 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG.2 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP R-1 $42,040.00 X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP S-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP T-1 $38,040.00 X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP U-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP V-1 X X $146,237.0
0

X X X X X X X X

GROUP W-1 X X X X X X X $36,440.00 X X X

GROUP X-1 X X X X X X X $36,640.00 X X X

GROUP Y-1 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-1 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP A-2 X X X X X $33,500.00 X X X X X

GROUP B-2 X X $213,689.0
0

X X X X X X X X

GROUP C-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-2 X X $285,485.0
0

X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-2 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 3 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP G-2 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP H-2 X X $44,590.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP I-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP J-2 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP K-2 $42,040.00 X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-2 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP N-2 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP O-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP P-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Q-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP R-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP S-2 X $37,190.00 X X X X X X X X X

GROUP T-2 X $37,190.00 X X X X X X X X X

GROUP U-2 X X X X X X $38,750.00 X X X X

GROUP V-2 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 4

CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP W-2 X X X  X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP X-2 X X X X X X X X X X $42,000.00

GROUP Y-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-2 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP A-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP B-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP C-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP G-3 X X $122,985.0
0

X X X X X $87,000.00 X X

GROUP H-3 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X $34,300.00 X

GROUP I-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP J-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP K-3 X X $46,388.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-3 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER       PG. 5 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP N-3 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP O-3 $63,040.00 X X X X X X $59,440.00 X X X

GROUP P-3 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP Q-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP R-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP S-3 $38,040.00 X X X X X X $35,390.00 X X X

GROUP T-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP U-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP V-3 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP W-3 X X X X X X X $36,640.00 X X X

GROUP X-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Y-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-3 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP A-4 $38,040.00 X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP B-4 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP C-4 X X X $39,800.00 X X X X X X X

GROUP D-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-4 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 6 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP F-4 $38,040.00 X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP G-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP H-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP I-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP J-4 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP K-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP N-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP O-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP P-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Q-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP R-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP S-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP T-4 X X X X X X $32,100.00 X X X X

GROUP U-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP V-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP W-4 X X $44,590.00 X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 7 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP X-4 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP Y-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-4 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP A-5 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP B-5 X X X X $32,760.00 $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP C-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-5 $38,040.00 X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-5 X X X X $32,760.00 X X X X X X

GROUP G-5 X X X X X X $32,100.00 X X X X

GROUP H-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP I-5 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP J-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP K-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-5 X X $86,237.50 X X X X X X X X

GROUP N-5 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X $34,300.00 X

GROUP O-5 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 8 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP P-5 X X X X X X X X X $34,300.00 NO BID X

GROUP Q-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP R-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP S-5 X X X X X $36,750.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP U-5 X X $47,890.00 X $32,760.00 X X X X X X

GROUP V-5 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP W-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP X-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Y-5 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-5 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP A-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP B-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP C-6 X X X X X X X X X $34,300.00 X

GROUP D-6 X X X X X X X X X $34,300.00 X

GROUP E-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-6 X X $47,890.00 $43,800.00 X X X X X X X

GROUP G-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 9 CRANE &
MACHINERY INC.

LEWIS
INTERTIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP H-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP I-6 X X $47,890.00 X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP J-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP K-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-6 X X $43,839.50 X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-6 X X $47,890.00 X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP N-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP O-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP P-6 X X $47,890.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP Q-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP R-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP S-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP T-6 X X X $39,800.00 X X X X X X X

GROUP U-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP V-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP W-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP X-6 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Y-6 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 10 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP Z-6 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP A-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP B-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP C-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP F-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP G-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP H-7 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP I-7 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP J-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP K-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP L-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP M-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP N-7 X X X X X $34,550.00 X X X X X

GROUP O-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP P-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Q-7 X X X X X X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 11 CRANE &
MACHINERY,INC.

LEWIS
INTERNATIONAL,

INC.

NORTHWEST
FORD

GLOBAL
EMERGENCY

VEHICLES

CESAR’S
EQUIPMENT CO.

MONROE TRUCK
EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANGLE
FABRICATION &

BODY

MCALLISTER
EQUIPMENT

CITY
INTERNATIONAL

TRUCKS, INC.

CITY UTILITY
EQUIPMENT

TENNANT CO. FINKBINER
EQUIPMENT

GROUP R-7 X X X X X X X X X X NO BID X

GROUP S-7 X X X X $32,760.00 X X X X X X

GROUP T-7 X X X $39,800.00 X X X X X X X

GROUP U-7 X X X X X X X $36,640.00 X X X

GROUP V-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP W-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP X-7 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP Y-7 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-7 X X X X X X X $35,100.00 X X X

GROUP A-8 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP B-8 X X $44,689.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP C-8 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP D-8 X X X X X X X X X X X

GROUP E-8 X X $44,500.00 X X X X X X X X

GROUP Z-8 X X $130,000.0
0

X X X $110,000.0
0

$88,000.00 X $100,000.0
0

X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP A-1 X X X X X X $40,200.00 X X X X X

GROUP B-1 X X $36,850.00 X X X $41,760.00 X X X $36,210.00 X

GROUP C-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-1 X X X $55,325.00 X X $53,750.00 $41,300.00 $24,750.00 X X X

GROUP E-1 X X X X $34,520.00 X $41,760.00 X $19,800.00 X X X

GROUP F-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP G-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP H-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X $36,760.00 $36,210.00 X

GROUP I-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP J-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $29,150.00 X X X

GROUP K-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X $34,500.00

GROUP M-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $18,700.00 X X X

GROUP N-1 X X X $42,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $18,700.00 X X X

GROUP O-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $22,550.00 X X $34,500.00

GROUP P-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $23,650.00 X X X

GROUP Q-1 X X X $42,820.00 X X $4,176,041,
760.00

X X X X X

GROUP R-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER          
PG.2

TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP S-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-1 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-1 X X X $617,820.00 X X $632,160.0
0

X $29,700.00 X X $286,500.00

GROUP V-1 X X X $145,250.00 X X $142,500.0
0

$127,500.0
0

X X X X

GROUP W-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP X-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP Y-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP Z-1 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $22,000.00 X $36,210.00 X

GROUP A-2 X X X X X X $40,200.00 X X X $35,100.00 X

GROUP B-2 X X X $205,320.00 X X $201,660.0
0

$187,900.0
0

$28,050.00 X X X

GROUP C-2 X X X $48,300.00 X X $48,000.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-2 X X X $274,300.00 X X $269,400.0
0

$241,000.0
0

$24,200.00 X X X

GROUP F-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP G-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP H-2 X X X $40,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER          PG.
3

TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP I-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $27,500.00 X X X

GROUP J-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP K-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X $34,500.00

GROUP M-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $19,250.00 $36,760.00 $36,210.00 X

GROUP N-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $23,100.00 X X X

GROUP O-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $19,800.00 X X X

GROUP P-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP Q-2 $44,180.00 X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP R-2 X X $34,850.00 X X X $41,760.00 X X X $36,210.00 X

GROUP S-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-2 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-2 X X X X X X $44,100.00 X $32,500.00 $38,500.00 $37,875.00 X

GROUP V-2 X X X $140,250.00 X X $142,500.0
0

X X X X X

GROUP W-2 X X $34,850.00 X X X $41,760.00 X $22,000.00 X X X

GROUP X-2 X X X $42,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP Y-2 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER       PG. 4 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK MCCANN

INDUSTRIE
S

GROUP Z-2 X X X X $34,520.00 X $41,760.00 X $18,150.00 X X X

GROUP A-3 X X $36,200.00 X X X $43,320.00 X X X $37,320.00 X

GROUP B-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X $36,210.00 X

GROUP C-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X $36,210.00 X

GROUP D-3 X X X $42,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP F-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X $34,500.00

GROUP G-3 X X X $107,385.00 X X $115,650.0
0

X $24,200.00 X $106,650.0
0

X

GROUP H-3 X X X $42,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-3 X $205,180.00 X $257,820.00 X X $263,160.0
0

X X X X $216,500.00

GROUP J-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP K-3 X X X X X X $43,320.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-3 X X X $44,250.00 X X $44,100.00 X $31,875.00 X X X

GROUP M-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $20,900.00 X X $34,500.00

GROUP N-3 X $34,180.00 X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $20,900.00 X X X

GROUP O-3 X X X $71,820.00 X X $72,510.00 X $26,466.00 X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 5 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP P-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $29,150.00 X X X

GROUP Q-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X $36,210.00 X

GROUP R-3 X $34,180.00 X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP S-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X $30,980.00

GROUP V-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $23,100.00 $36,760.00 $36,210.00 X

GROUP W-3 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X X X X $36,500.00

GROUP X-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X $26,300.00 X $36,210.00 X

GROUP Y-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP Z-3 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP A-4 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP B-4 X X $34,850.00 $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP C-4 X X X X $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X X X X $30,980.00

GROUP D-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-4 X X X X X X $47,300.00 X X X X X

GROUP F-4 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X X X

GROUP G-4 X X $39,850.00 X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 6 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP H-4 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-4 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $16,500.00 X X X

GROUP J-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP K-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-4 X X X X X X $41,760.00 X X X X X

GROUP M-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP N-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $12,100.00 X X X

GROUP O-4 X X X $41,820.00 X X $41,760.00 X $23,650.00 X X $34,500.00

GROUP P-4 X X X X X $55,750.00 $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP Q-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP R-4 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X $35,500.00

GROUP S-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X X X

GROUP T-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-4 X X $34,850.00 X X X $37,160.00 X X X X $30,980.00

GROUP V-4 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP W-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X $34,500.00

GROUP X-4 X X $34,850.00 $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X X X

GROUP Y-4 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 7 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS37160
TRACTOR

CO37160., INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP Z-4 X X X $137,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $28,600.00 X X X

GROUP A-5 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X $31,760.00 X X

GROUP B-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $28,050.00 $31,760.00 $32,210.00 X

GROUP C-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $36,420.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-5 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP F-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP G-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP H-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 $31,760.00 $32,210.00 X

GROUP J-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP K-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP M-5 X X X X X X $69,500.00 X $25,000.00 X $63,875.00 X

GROUP N-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $23,100.00 X X X

GROUP O-5 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X X X

GROUP P-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X X X

GROUP Q-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 8 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCXK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP R-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP S-5 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-5 $41,780.00 X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP V-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP W-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP X-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $33,000.00 X X X

GROUP Y-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $33,000.00 X X X

GROUP Z-5 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $28,600.00 X X X

GROUP A-6 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP B-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP C-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-6 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP F-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP G-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP H-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 9 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS37160
TRACTOR

CO37160., INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP J-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP K-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP L-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X $31,660.00 X

GROUP M-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $15,400.00 X X X

GROUP N-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X X X

GROUP O-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $28,050.00 X X X

GROUP P-6 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $29,150.00 X X X

GROUP Q-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $18,700.00 X X X

GROUP R-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $18,700.00 X X X

GROUP S-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP T-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP U-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP V-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP W-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP X-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $22,000.00 X X X

GROUP Y-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $28,600.00 X X X

GROUP Z-6 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $22,550.00 X X X

GROUP A-7 X X X $41,820.00 $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 10 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP B-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $16,500.00 X X X

GROUP C-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-7 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $14,850.00 X X X

GROUP E-7 X X X $42,820.00 $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP F-7 X X X $41,820.00 $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X X $30,980.00

GROUP G-7 X X X X $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP H-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X $32,210.00 X

GROUP I-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X $32,210.00 X

GROUP J-7 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $25,800.00 X X X

GROUP K-7 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 X X X

GROUP L-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $15,950.00 X X X

GROUP M-7 X X X X $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X $16,500.00 X X X

GROUP N-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $8,800.00 $26,760.00 X X

GROUP O-7 X X X $41,820.00 $32,920.00 X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X X X

GROUP P-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $24,200.00 X $32,210.00 X

GROUP Q-7 X X X X X X $371,670.0
0

X X X $32,210.00 X

GROUP R-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP S-7 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 $30,360.00 X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 11 TRYAD
AUTOMOTIVE

CASEY
EQUIPMENT

H.C.I.
TRANSPORTATI

ON & TECH.

CHRISTOFANO
EQUIP. CO., INC.

INGERSOLL-
RAND EQUIP. &

SERVICES

SNAP-ON
INDUSTRIAL

HARTS
TRACTOR CO.,

INC.

JIMMY DIESEL MUTUAL TRUCK
PARTS

MAURELLO
SERVICE

BLITZ BUS &
TRUCK

MCCANN
INDUSTRIES

GROUP T-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X $32,210.00 X

GROUP U-7 X X X $42,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP V-7 X X X $41,820.00 X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP W-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 $40,400.00 X X $32,210.00 X

GROUP X-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $29,700.00 X $32,210.00 X

GROUP Y-7 X X X X $34,520.00 X $37,160.00 X $28,600.00 X X X

GROUP Z-7 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $25,300.00 X X X

GROUP A-8 X X $34,850.00 X X X $37,160.00 X X $31,760.00 X X

GROUP B-8 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $24,750.00 X $32,210.00 X

GROUP C-8 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X X X

GROUP D-8 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X $15,400.00 X X X

GROUP E-8 X X X X X X $37,160.00 X X X $32,210.00 X

GROUP Z-8 $100,000.0
0

X $125,000.0
0

$120,000.00 X X $139,000.0
0

$125,000.0
0

X $85,000.00 $100,000.0
0

X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP A-1 NO BID X X X $41,200.00 X X

GROUP B-1 X X X X X X

GROUP C-1 X X X X X X

GROUP D-1 X $45,250.00 X $54,475.00 X X

GROUP E-1 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP F-1 X X X X X

GROUP G-1 X X X X X X

GROUP H-1 X X X X X X

GROUP I-1 X X X X X X

GROUP J-1 X X X X X X

GROUP K-1 X X X X X X

GROUP L-1 $33,850.00 X X X X X

GROUP M-1 X X X X X X

GROUP N-1 X X X X X X

GROUP O-1 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP P-1 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP Q-1 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG.2 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP R-1 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP S-1 X X X X X X

GROUP T-1 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP U-1 X X X X X X

GROUP V-1 X $116,875.0
0

X X X X

GROUP W-1 X X X X X X

GROUP X-1 X X X X X X

GROUP Y-1 X X X X X X

GROUP Z-1 X $34,850.00 X X X X

GROUP A-2 X X X X X X

GROUP B-2 X $164,850.0
0

X $211,720.0
0

X X

GROUP C-2 X X X X X X

GROUP D-2 X X X X X X

GROUP E-2 X X X $282,800.0
0

X X

GROUP F-2 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP G-2 X X X X X X

GROUP H-2 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 3 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP I-2 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP J-2 X X $33,860.00 X X X

GROUP K-2 X X X X X X

GROUP L-2 X X X X X X

GROUP M-2 X X X X X X

GROUP N-2 $33,850.00 X X X X X

GROUP O-2 X X X X X X

GROUP P-2 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP Q-2 X X X X X X

GROUP R-2 X X X X X X

GROUP S-2 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP T-2 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP U-2 X X X X X X

GROUP V-2 X X X X X X

GROUP W-2 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP X-2 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 4

MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP Y-2 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP Z-2 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP A-3 X X X X X X

GROUP B-3 X X X X X X

GROUP C-3 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP D-3 X X X X X X

GROUP E-3 X X X X X X

GROUP F-3 X X X X X X

GROUP G-3 X X X X X X

GROUP H-3 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP I-3 X X X X X X

GROUP J-3 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP K-3 X X X X X X

GROUP L-3 X X X X X X

GROUP M-3 X X X X X X

GROUP N-3 X X X X X X

GROUP O-3 $33,850.00 X X $75,220.00 X X

GROUP P-3 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER         PG. 5 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP Q-3 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP R-3 X X X X X X

GROUP S-3 X X X X X X

GROUP T-3 X X X X X X

GROUP U-3 X X X X X X

GROUP V-3 X X X X X X

GROUP W-3 X X X X X X

GROUP X-3 X X X X X X

GROUP Y-3 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP Z-3 X X X X X X

GROUP A-4 X X X $34,920.00 X X

GROUP B-4 X X X X X X

GROUP C-4 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP D-4 $33,850.00 X X X X X

GROUP E-4 X X X X X X

GROUP F-4 X X X X X X

GROUP G-4 X X X X X X

GROUP H-4 X X X X X X

GROUP I-4 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 6 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.XS,
INC.STVE’S

EQUIPMENT
SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP J-4 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP K-4 X X X X X X

GROUP L-4 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP M-4 X X X X X X

GROUP N-4 X X X X $36,510.00 X

GROUP O-4 X X X X X X

GROUP P-4 X X X X X X

GROUP Q-4 X X X X X X

GROUP R-4 X X X X X X

GROUP S-4 X X X X X X

GROUP T-4 X X X X X X

GROUP U-4 X X X X $35,510.00 X

GROUP V-4 X X X X X $40,510.00

GROUP W-4 X X X X X X

GROUP X-4 X X X X X X

GROUP Y-4 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP Z-4 X X X X $145,510.0
0

X

GROUP A-5 X X X X X X

GROUP B-5 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 7 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP C-5 NO BID X X X X X

GROUP D-5 X X X X X X

GROUP E-5 X X X X X X

GROUP F-5 X X X X X X

GROUP G-5 X X X X X X

GROUP H-5 $33,850.00 X X X X X

GROUP I-5 X X X X X X

GROUP J-5 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP K-5 X X X X X X

GROUP L-5 X X X X X X

GROUP M-5 X $66,875.00 X X X X

GROUP N-5 X X X X X X

GROUP O-5 X X X $36,720.00 X X

GROUP P-5 X X X X X X

GROUP Q-5 X X X X X X

GROUP R-5 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP S-5 X X X X X X

GROUP T-5 X X X X X X

GROUP U-5 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 8 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP V-5 NO BID X X X X $40,510.00 X

GROUP W-5 X X X X X X

GROUP X-5 X X X X $40,510.00 X

GROUP Y-5 X X X X $40,510.00 X

GROUP Z-5 X X X X $40,510.00 X

GROUP A-6 X X X X $40,510.00 X

GROUP B-6 X X X X X X

GROUP C-6 X X X X X X

GROUP D-6 X X X X X X

GROUP E-6 X X X X X X

GROUP F-6 X X X X X X

GROUP G-6 X X X $34,920.00 X X

GROUP H-6 X X X X X X

GROUP I-6 X X X X X X

GROUP J-6 X X X $42,720.00 X X

GROUP K-6 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP L-6 X X X X X X

GROUP M-6 X X X X X X

GROUP N-6 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 9 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP O-6 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP P-6 X X X X $41,510.00 X

GROUP Q-6 X X X $37,520.00 X X

GROUP R-6 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP S-6 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP T-6 X X X X X X

GROUP U-6 X X X $37,520.00 X X

GROUP V-6 X X X $37,520.00 X X

GROUP W-6 X X X $37,520.00 X X

GROUP X-6 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP Y-6 X X X X X $41,510.00

GROUP Z-6 X X X $37,520.00 X X

GROUP A-7 X X X X X $37,510.00

GROUP B-7 X X X $37,720.00 X X

GROUP C-7 X X X $37,720.00 X X

GROUP D-7 X X X $37,720.00 X X

GROUP E-7 X X X X X X

GROUP F-7 X X X X X $39,510.00

GROUP G-7 X X X X X $39,510.00



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 10 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP H-7 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP I-7 X $34,850.00 X X X X

GROUP J-7 X X X X $35,510.00 X

GROUP K-7 X X X $35,720.00 X

GROUP L-7 X X X X X X

GROUP M-7 X X X X X $38,510.00

GROUP N-7 X X X X X X

GROUP O-7 X X X X X $39,510.00

GROUP P-7 X X X X X X

GROUP Q-7 X X X X X X

GROUP R-7 X X X X X X

GROUP S-7 X X X X X X

GROUP T-7 X X X X X X

GROUP U-7 X X X X X X

GROUP V-7 X X X X X X

GROUP W-7 X X X X X X

GROUP X-7 X X X X X X

GROUP Y-7 X X X X X $35,510.00

GROUP Z-7 X X X X X X



BID TABULATION

Specification Number: B29295042                                                                                                                                                Date: April 17, 2002

Project Description: PARTS AND SERVICE FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 11 MIDWAY DODGE STANDARD
EQUIPMENT

STANDARD
TRUCK CENTER

B&B
ASSOCIATED

IND.

S.E.S,
INC.STEVE’S
EQUIPMENT

SERVICE, INC.

WILL RENT, INC. PORTABLE
TOOL

GROUP A-8 NO BID X X X X X X

GROUP B-8 X X X X X X

GROUP C-8 X X X X X X

GROUP D-8 X $34,850.00 X X X X

GROUP E-8 X X X X X X

GROUP Z-8 X X X $130,000.0
0

$130,000.0
0

$130,000.0
0

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


