
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940023                                                                                                                                               Date: December 10, 2002

Project Description:  VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 Patel Imtiyaz WISCAN Ideal Auto Ent.,
Inc.

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Richards Auto
Sales

Ramon Alvarez Derby Hill
Equipment

Larry Banks Clark
Maintenance

Ramiro Jiminez Tom McIntosh Charles Malak

1) BH0039 X X X NO BID X X NO BID X X X X X

2) 13202 X X $869.00 $255.00 $225.00 X $400.00 $425.00 X X

3) DT100L X X X X $195.00 X $400.00 X X X

4) A341 X X $259.00 $35.00 X X X X X X

5) S3561 X X X X X X $400.00 X X X

6) S3854 X X X $35.00 X X X X X X

7) A389 X X $169.00 $51.00 X X X X X X

8) DT0136 X X X X $225.00 X $500.00 X X X

9) 13995 X X $129.00 $35.00 X X X X X X

10) 13353 X $1,367.87 $869.00 $55.00 $175.00 X $1,500.00 X X X

11) PV0109 X X $669.00 $35.00 X X X X X X

12) PN0015 X X $369.00 $35.00 $175.00 X $1,000.00 X X X

13) PN0001 X X $469.00 $35.00 X X X X X XX

14) HS112L X X X X X X X X X X

15) HS110L X X X X $225.00 X X X X X

16) 12337 X X X X X X X X X X

17) A342 X X $229.00 $35.00 X X X X $89.50 X

18) BH0045 X X X X $335.00 X $400.00 X X X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940023                                                                                                                                               Date: December 10, 2002

Project Description:  VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 Patel Imtiyaz WISCAN Ideal Auto Ent.,
Inc.

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Richards Auto
Sales

Ramon Alvarez Derby Hill
Equipment

Larry Banks Clark
Maintenance

Ramiro Jiminez Tom McIntosh Charles Malak

19) PV0114 X X $369.00 $35.00 X X X X X X

20) PV2083 X X X NO BID X X NO BID X $200.00 X X X

21) 13640 X X X $151.00 $305.00 X $700.00 $1,550.00 X X

22) 14008 $300.99 X X X X X $700.00 X X X

23) GS11L X X X X $285.00 X $700.00 X X X

24) PR0015 X X $669.00 $35.00 X $300.90 $300.00 X X $226.67



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940023                                                                                                                                               Date: December 10, 2002

Project Description:  VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 A&M Auto T&B Cartage Patricias
Trucking

Mr. D’s Towing
& Auto Sales

Ilyas

1) BH0039 $1,856.00 X NO BID X X

2) 13202 $1,006.00 $545.85 $621.00 $350.00

3) DT100L $205.00 X X X

4) A341 $205.00 $757.76 X X

5) S3561 $200.00 X X X

6) S3854 X X X X

7) A389 X X X X

8) DT0136 $155.00 X X X

9) 13995 X X X X

10) 13353 $295.00 $356.75 X $450.00

11) PV0109 $255.00 $776.85 X $300.00

12) PN0015 $290.00 $256.78 X X

13) PN0001 $295.00 X X $450.00

14) HS112L X X X X

15) HS110L X X X X

16) 12337 $85.55 $210.53 $451.00 X

17) A342 X $756.85 X X

18) BH0045 $205.00 $758.75 X $300.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940023                                                                                                                                               Date: December 10, 2002

Project Description:  VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl  

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 A&M Auto T&B Cartage Patricias
Trucking

Mr. D’s Towing
& Auto Sales

Ilyas

19) PV0114 X X NO BID X $199.00

20) PV2083 X $155.76 X X

21) 13640 $1,105.00 $776.56 X $850.00

22) 14008 $1,105.00 $758.76 X $1,800.00

23) GS11L X X X X

24) PR0015 $295.00 X X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


