
SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940003                                                                                                                                              Date: May 6, 2002

Project Description: USED GARBAGE TRUCKS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 Jim Carew Auto
Wholesaler

s

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Nicolas
Robles

Gaspar
Gonzalez

Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Adelman’s
Truck

Parts Corp.

Trucks &
Parts of

Ohio

FLOOD BROS
DISPOSAL

ANDY’S
TRUCK
EQ.,CO.

ERICKSON
TRUCKS “N”

PARTS

10204 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,701.00 $3,569.00 $3,000.00 $1,649.00 $3,857.00

10205 $2,610.00 $3,369.00 X $1,649.00 $3,637.00

10206 $2,670.00 $1,369.00 X $1,589.00 $2,337.00

10214 $1,888.00 $2,769.00 X $1,589.00 $2,257.00

10216 $1,751.00 $1,369.00 X $1,589.00 $3,637.00

10218 $2,686.00 $2,569.00 X $1,699.00 $3,837.00

10219 $2,637.00 $2,269.00 X $1,739.00 $1,807.00

10223 $2,637.00 $1,769.00 X $1,739.00 $3,637.00

10225 $2,637.00 $1,569.00 X $1,749.00 $3,637.00

10226 $2,641.00 $1,369.00 X $1,689.00 $2,337.00

10227 $2,441.00 $1,369.00 X $1,689.00 $2,807.00

10230 $2,572.00 $2,169.00 X $1,739.00 $2,307.00

10231 $2,608.00 $1,369.00 X $1,799.00 $2,337.00

10233 $2,572.00 $2,669.00 X $1,799.00 $2,777.00

10234 $2,637.00 $1,769.00 X $1,689.00 $1,777.00

10244 $2,416.00 $2,669.00 X $1,749.00 $2,807.00



SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940003                                                                                                                                              Date: May 6, 2002

Project Description: USED GARBAGE TRUCKS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 Jim Carew Auto
Wholesaler

s

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

Nicolas
Robles

Gaspar
Gonzalez

Vintage
Vehicles &

Parts

Adelman’s
Truck

Parts Corp.

Trucks &
Parts of

Ohio

FLOOD BROS
DISPOSAL

ANDY”S
TRUCK
EQ.,CO.

ERICKSON
TRUCKS “N”

PARTS

10248 $2,672.00 $2,469.00 X $1,749.00 $2,607.00

10258 $1,551.00 $696.00 X $1,989.00 $1,327.00

10229 $2,671.00 $3,169.00 $3,000.00 $1,749.00 $3,807.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 



SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940003                                                                                                                                              Date: May 6, 2002

Project Description: USED GARBAGE TRUCKS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 MYERS
TRUCK SALES

COZZI IRON &
METAL, INC.

10204 $1,505.00 $400.00

10205 $1,505.00 $400.00

10206 $910.00 $400.00

10214 $605.00 $400.00

10216 $510.00 $400.00

10218 $820.00 $400.00

10219 $925.00 $400.00

10223 $1,005.00 $400.00

10225 $960.00 $400.00

10226 $960.00 $400.00

10227 $500.00 $400.00

10230 $805.00 $400.00

10231 $605.00 $400.00

10233 $820.00 $400.00

10234 $505.00 $400.00

10244 $1,205.00 $400.00



SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940003                                                                                                                                              Date: May 6, 2002

Project Description: USED GARBAGE TRUCKS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                    Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 MYERS
TRUCK SALES

COZZI IRON &
METAL, INC.

10248 $970.00 $400.00

10258 $410.00 $400.00

10229 $1,505.00 $400.00


