
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940019                                                                                                                                               Date: October 28, 2002

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 T&B Cartage LV Trucking,
Inc.

Auto
Wholesalers

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts, Inc.

McCoy Auto
Parts & Glass

Luis Torres Tom McIntosh Derby Hill
Equipment

Richards Auto
Sales

Ramon Alvarez Paul McKinley North Shore
Recycling

1) BH0048 $251.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.00 X X NO BID $31.00 X X NO BID

2) BH0101 $245.65 $50.00 X X $51.00 $295.00 X

3) BH0102 $251.85 $50.00 X X $31.00 $155.00 X

4) CS0100 $178.56 $50.00 X X $31.00 $195.00 X

5) DT0511 X $50.00 X X $31.00 X X

6) DT1000 X $50.00 $1,268.00 X $55.00 X $500.00

7) FDA308 X $50.00 X X $31.00 X X

8) FDA333 X $50.00 X X $55.00 X X

9) FDA335 X $50.00 X X $55.00 X X

10) FDA339 X $50.00 X $677.50 $76.00 X X

11) FDA371 X $50.00 X X $61.00 X X

12) FDC786 $768.59 $50.00 X X $265.00 X X

13) GSO158 X $50.00 $710.00 X $76.00 X X

14) GS1013 X $50.00 X X $31.00 X X

15) HR1000 X $50.00 $792.00 X $76.00 X X

16) PV0113 X $50.00 X X $31.00 X X

17) SO3606 $245.56 $50.00 X X $31.00 $155.00 X



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940019                                                                                                                                               Date: October 28, 2002

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:  J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 T&B Cartage LV Trucking,
Inc.

Auto
Wholesalers

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts, Inc.

McCoy Auto
Parts & Glass

Luis Torres Tom McIntosh Derby Hill
Equipment

Richards Auto
Sales

Ramon Alvarez Paul McKinley North Shore
Recycling

18) S13339 X NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.00 X X NO BID $202.00 X X X

19) S13985 X $50.00 X X $106.00 X X NO BID

20) S13990 $150.75 $110.00 X X $221.00 X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


