DEMOLITION TABULATION

Specification Number: C968-02-0025 Date: September 23, 2002

Project Description: Request for Demolition Bids Court Ordered Class "D" Demolition Bids



Addendum1234		Contract Administrator. C. Sammons				
Luttrell Excavating & Demolition	ACS, Inc.	Dan-Mar Demolition	Paige Enterprises	Dynamic Wrecking & Excavating	Anrab One, Inc.	Delta Demolition
NO BID	NO BID	\$4,685.00	\$4,800.00	\$5,995.00	\$4,800.00	\$5,300.00
		X	\$7,300.00	\$9,500.00	\$9,800.00	X
		\$5,300.00	\$5,500.00	\$6,950.00	\$5,900.00	\$6,700.00
		\$5,700.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,700.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,700.00
		\$9,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$5,400.00	\$4,800.00	X
		X	\$5,000.00	\$9,995.00	\$12,000.00	\$8,300.00
		\$13,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$9,995.00	\$5,900.00	\$7,100.00
		\$4,375.00	\$4,300.00	\$5,995.00	\$4,000.00	\$5,300.00
		\$2,500.00	\$2,000.00	X	\$1,400.00	\$1,700.00
	Luttrell Excavating & Demolition	Luttrell Excavating ACS, Inc. & Demolition	Luttrell Excavating & Demolition ACS, Inc. Dan-Mar Demolition NO BID \$4,685.00 X \$5,300.00 \$5,700.00 \$9,000.00 X \$13,000.00 \$4,375.00	Luttrell Excavating & Demolition ACS, Inc. Dan-Mar Demolition Paige Enterprises NO BID \$4,685.00 \$4,800.00 X \$7,300.00 \$5,300.00 \$5,500.00 \$5,700.00 \$4,000.00 X \$5,000.00 X \$5,000.00 \$13,000.00 \$5,500.00 \$4,375.00 \$4,300.00	Luttrell Excavating & Demolition ACS, Inc. Dan-Mar Demolition Paige Enterprises Dynamic Wrecking & Excavating NO BID \$4,685.00 \$4,800.00 \$5,995.00 X \$7,300.00 \$9,500.00 \$5,300.00 \$5,500.00 \$6,950.00 \$5,700.00 \$4,000.00 \$4,700.00 X \$5,000.00 \$5,400.00 X \$5,000.00 \$9,995.00 \$13,000.00 \$5,500.00 \$9,995.00 \$4,375.00 \$4,300.00 \$5,995.00	Luttrell Excavating & Demolition ACS, Inc. Dan-Mar Demolition Paige Enterprises Dynamic Wrecking & Excavating Anrab One, Inc. NO BID \$4,685.00 \$4,800.00 \$5,995.00 \$4,800.00 X \$7,300.00 \$9,500.00 \$9,800.00 \$5,300.00 \$5,500.00 \$6,950.00 \$5,900.00 \$5,700.00 \$4,000.00 \$4,700.00 \$5,000.00 X \$5,000.00 \$5,400.00 \$4,800.00 X \$5,000.00 \$9,995.00 \$12,000.00 \$13,000.00 \$5,500.00 \$9,995.00 \$5,900.00 \$4,375.00 \$4,300.00 \$5,995.00 \$4,000.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago Richard M. Daley, Mayor Department of Procurement Services

David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer