
                 SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940012                                                         Date: June 16, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED EQUIPMENT               

Bid Deposit:                                       Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                 Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER S18016 S18018 S18022 S18024 S18025 S18026 S18027 S18030

S.E.S Inc. $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $4,275.00

Illiana Truck Parts, Inc. $206.03 $206.03 $206.03 $206.03 $206.03 $206.03 $206.03 $206.03

Andy’s Truck & Equipment $1,069.00 $1,129.00 $1,079.00 $1,089.00 $1,119.00 $1,069.00 $1,059.00 $1,029.00

Minas Klivas NO BID

Trucks & Parts of Ohio NO BID

Al Witvoet & Sons $1,725.00 $1,325.10 $1,400.00 $1,177.00 $1,250.00 $1,300.00 $1,100.00 $1,200.00

Richards Auto Sales NO BID

Auto Wholesalers NO BID

Vintage Vehicles & Parts,
Inc.

NO BID

Midwest Equip. Sales &
Service

$5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00

Erickson Trucks-N-Parts $8,337.77 $7,777.77 $5,261.77 $5,661.77 $3,311.77 $9,137.77 $6,337.77 $4,316.77

Adelman’s Truck Parts
Corp.

$3,528.00 $3,788.00 $2,862.00 $4,282.00 $3,672.00 $4,282.00 $2,532.00 $4,282.00

Derby Hill Equipment $1,267.00 $967.00 $967.00 $967.00 $967.00 $1,267.00 $767.00 $967.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
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