
SALVAGE  TABULATION
Specification Number: F4998940001                                                                                                                                                            Date: February 4, 2004

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                   Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER          Trucks & Parts
of Ohio

Adelman’s
Truck Parts

Corp.

Derby Hill
Equipment

Norm Nevinger Andy’s Truck
& Equip. Co.

John Wright Richards Auto
Sales

Auto
Wholesalers

McCoy Auto
Parts

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

1) 13316 $169.00 $963.00 NO BID $75.00 $769.00 X NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID $527.11

2) 11318 $569.00 $1,163.00 $100.00 $839.00 x $175.00 $657.11

3) 11326 $869.00 $1,327.00 $75.00 $929.00 x $175.00 $777.11

4) 11329 $469.00 $1,063.00 $100.00 $839.00 x $175.00 $657.11

5) 11338 $569.00 $1,023.00 $75.00 $859.00 x $175.00 $657.11

6) 11339 $569.00 $1,163.00 $125.00 $879.00 x $175.00 $637.11

7) 11340 $669.00 $1,136.00 $100.00 $929.00 x $175.00 $627.11

8) 11347 $1,069.00 $1,357.00 $75.00 $1,029.00 x $175.00 $1,067.11

9) 11356 $869.00 $1,152.00 $100.00 $839.00 x $175.00 $557.11

10) 11358 $569.00 $1,033.00 $75.00 $729.00 x $175.00 $537.11

11) 11362 $369.00 $561.00 $125.00 $729.00 x $175.00 $527.11

12) 11369 $769.00 $1,266.00 $100.00 $929.00 x $175.00 $777.11

13) 11372 $1,069.00 $1,357.00 $75.00 $929.00 x $175.00 $777.11

14) 11373 $1,069.00 $1,357.00 $125.00 $939.00 x $175.00 $1,057.11

15) 11374 $569.00 $1,227.00 $150.00 $849.00 x $175.00 $757.11

16) 11375 $1,069.00 $1,327.00 $75.00 $949.00 x $175.00 $867.11

17) 11376 $369.00 $1,023.00 $100.00 $789.00 x $175.00 $667.11

18) 10338 $2,069.00 $2,688.00 $400.00 $1,159.00 x $75.00 $657.11

19) 12081 $69.00 $978.00 $400.00 $389.00 $201.00 $175.00 $1,127.11



SALVAGE  TABULATION
Specification Number: F4998940001                                                                                                                                                            Date: February 4, 2004

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                   Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

Name of Bidder    Pg. 2 Trucks & Parts
of Ohio

Adelman’s
Truck Parts

Corp.

Derby Hill
Equipment

Norm Nevinger Andy’s Truck
& Equip. Co.

John Wright Richards Auto
Sales

Auto
Wholesalers

McCoy Auto
Parts

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

20) 12716 $3,069.00 $1,888.00 NO BID $400.00 $1,659.00 x NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID $917.11

21) 12717 $3,069.00 $2,151.00 $400.00 $1,759.00 x $175.00 $857.11

22) 11345 $969.00 $1,357.00 $100.00 $929.00 x $175.00 $857.11

23) 12721 $3,269.00 $1,922.00 $400.00 $1,659.00 x $175.00 $1,107.11

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   City of Chicago   Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor Eric J. Griggs, Acting Chief Procurement Officer Eric J. Griggs, Acting Chief Procurement Officer 


